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FAUhosts'groundgreening'event
forCollegeofEngineering'snewbuilding

Florida Atlantic
University (FAU) recently
celebrated the official
"ground greening" of the
College of Engineering
and Computer Science's
Engineering I building.
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Being environmentally
conscious was the theme
of the day's event. Hard .

, hats, gi-een shovels and
bags of dirt were provided
for awaiting digilitaries,
but no digging took place. .

The Engineering
1buildingprojectis
registered with the

. U.S.Green Building
Councilwith a university'
commitmentto achieve .
Leadershipin Energyand
EnvironmentalDesign ,

(LEED)PlatinumCertifi-
cation,the highest level
of LEEDcertification
possible.

The LEEDcertification
ensures the buildingis
energy-efficient,uses
innovativetechnologies
and offersusers a
dean, healthy interior
environment.

Forinformation,visit
www.engJau.edu
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From left: Michael Corbit, Peter LoBelia, Roxanna Trinka, Fred
Yentz and Chris Fleck
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